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Item 1.01. Entry into a Material Definitive Agreement.

Issuance of Warrants
 
As previously announced, on November 5, 2020, Ocuphire Pharma, Inc., formerly known as Rexahn Pharmaceuticals, Inc. (the “Company”), completed its business
combination with Ocuphire Pharma, Inc., a Delaware corporation (“Ocuphire Sub”), whereby a subsidiary of the Company merged with and into Ocuphire Sub (the
“Merger”), the Company changed its name to “Ocuphire Pharma, Inc.” and the business conducted by the Company became the business conducted by Ocuphire Sub. In
addition, as previously announced, immediately prior to the Merger, the Company and Ocuphire Sub completed a private placement transaction (the “Pre-Merger
Financing”) with certain accredited investors (the “Investors”) pursuant to that certain Amended and Restated Securities Purchase Agreement, dated June 29, 2020, among
the Company, Ocuphire Sub and the Investors (the “Securities Purchase Agreement”) for an aggregate purchase price of approximately $21.15 million. As of November 5,
2020, immediately following the Merger, there were 10,841,870 shares of the Company’s common stock (“Common Stock”) outstanding (including shares issued in escrow
as described below).
 
Pursuant to the Pre-Merger Financing, (i) Ocuphire Sub issued and sold to the Investors shares of Ocuphire Sub’s common stock (the “Initial Shares”) which converted
pursuant to the exchange ratio in the Merger into an aggregate of approximately 1,249,996 shares (the “Converted Initial Shares”) of Common Stock, (ii) Ocuphire Sub
deposited into escrow, for the benefit of the Investors, additional shares of Ocuphire Sub’s common stock (the “Additional Shares”) which converted pursuant to the
exchange ratio in the Merger into an aggregate of approximately 3,749,992 shares of Common Stock (the “Converted Additional Shares”), which Converted Additional
Shares were delivered (or became deliverable) to the Investors on November 19, 2020, and (iii) the Company agreed to issue to each Investor on the tenth trading day
following the consummation of the Merger (x) Series A Warrants representing the right to acquire shares of Common Stock equal to the sum of (A) the Converted Initial
Shares purchased by the Investor, (B) the Converted Additional Shares delivered or deliverable to the Investor, without giving effect to any limitation on delivery contained
in the Securities Purchase Agreement and (C) the initial number of shares of Common Stock, if any, underlying the Series B Warrants issued to the Investor (the “Series A
Warrants”) and (y) additional warrants to purchase shares of Common Stock (the “Series B Warrants” and together with the Series A Warrants, the “Warrants”).
 
On November 19, 2020, pursuant to the terms of the Securities Purchase Agreement, the Company issued the Series A Warrants and the Series B Warrants.
 
The Series A Warrants were issued on November 19, 2020 at an initial exercise price of $4.4795 per share, were immediately exercisable upon issuance and have a term of
five years from the date of issuance. The Series A Warrants are exercisable for 5,665,838 shares of Common Stock in the aggregate (without giving effect to any limitation
on exercise contained therein).
 
The Series B Warrants have an exercise price of $0.0001, were exercisable upon issuance and will expire on the day following the later to occur of (i) the Reservation Date
(as defined therein), and (ii) the date on which the Investor’s Series B Warrants have been exercised in full (without giving effect to any limitation on exercise contained
therein) and no shares remain issuable thereunder. The Series B Warrants are initially exercisable for 665,837 shares of Common Stock in the aggregate (without giving
effect to any limitation on exercise contained therein).

For a description of the Series A Warrants and Series B Warrants, please refer to “Agreements Related to the Merger—Pre-Merger Financing” in the Company’s
prospectus/definitive proxy statement filed with the U.S. Securities and Exchange Commission (the “SEC”) on October 2, 2020 (the “Proxy Statement”), which description
is incorporated herein by reference.
 
The above descriptions of the Series A Warrants and Series B Warrants are not complete, and are qualified in their entirety by reference to the complete text of the form of
Series A Warrant and form of Series B Warrant, respectively, which were filed together as exhibit 4.1 to the Company’s Current Report on Form 8-K filed on July 1, 2020,
and which forms will be filed as separate exhibits to the Company’s Annual Report on Form 10-K for the year ending December 31, 2020.

1



Item 3.02 Unregistered Sales of Equity Securities

The information set forth in Item 1.01 of this Current Report on Form 8-K is incorporated by reference into this Item 3.02.

The Company issued the Warrants to the Investors in reliance on the exemption from registration provided for under Section 4(a)(2) of the Securities Act. The Company
relied on this exemption from registration for private placements based in part on the representations made by the Investors, including the representations with respect to
each Investor’s status as an “accredited investor,” as such term is defined in Rule 501(a) of the Securities Act, and the Investors’ investment intent.
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SIGNATURES

Pursuant to the requirements of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, the registrant has duly caused this report to be signed on its behalf by the undersigned
hereunto duly authorized.

OCUPHIRE PHARMA, INC.
 

Date: November 25, 2020 By: /s/ Mina Sooch
 Mina Sooch
 President and Chief Executive Officer
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